

RESOLUTION 2026-02-23-03

BE IT RESOLVED, that the Shelby County Commission hereby awards the bid for Cleaning Items to the lowest overall bidder, Budget Janitorial Supply as attached.

Said eBid #2025-12-11621 is located within the office of the Chief Financial Officer.

	11400 LLC	American Osment	Budget	Quill	Mini Wing	WTM	Unipak	Interboro A	Interboro B	Interboro C	Interboro D
Toilet Bowl Mop with 12" Handle											
Each	3.86	0.95	1.25	\$ 1.52	\$ 1.50	39.00 / 25					
1 gallon bleach	3.86	0.95	1.25	\$ 1.52	\$ 1.50	124.00 / 6 gal					
Price Per	31.49 / 6 gal	26.55 / 6	19.95 / 6 gal	9.66 / 1	26.60 / 6 gal						
Gallon											
Pine Sol	5.2483	4.425	3.325	\$ 9.66	\$ 4.433	\$ 20.667					
Price Per	29.24 / 4 gal	48.70 / 3	39.80 / 3 (80 oz)	14.88 for 80oz	45.00 / 3	\$ 17.00					
Price Per	7.31 per gal	\$ 16.23	13.27 per 80 oz	14.88 for 80 oz	15.00 each 80 oz	17.00 per gallon					
Ounce	.057		.166 per ounce		.1875 per ounce	.1328 per oz					
Comet	65.69 / 8	53.35 / 24	36.00 / 24	\$ 0.186	\$ 0.1875	\$ 0.1328					
Price Per											
Each	8.21	2.22	1.50	\$ 3.79	\$ 2.25	\$ 2.33					
Dumpster D & C	no bid	79.35 / 25 lbs	38.24 / 18lb	no bid	35.00 / 18 lb	69.00 / 5 GAL					
Pound		3.17 per lb	2.12 per lb		1.94 per lb	13.80 per gal					
Clorox Disinfecting Spray											
Price Per	79.64 / 12 (19 oz)	89.05 / 12	42.00 / 12 (16.5 oz)	6.17 / 1 (32oz)	55.00 / 9 (32oz)	87.00 / 12 (19oz)					
Ounce	6.64 each for 19 oz	7.42	3.50 for 16.5 oz	6.17 for 32 oz	6.11 for 32 oz	7.25 for 19 oz					
Joy Dishwashing Liquid	.35 per oz	.39 per oz	.21 per oz	.19 per oz	.19 per oz	.38 per oz					
Price Per	36.44 / 10 (30 oz)	51.80 / 8	51.40 / 8 (38 oz)	16.94 / gal (128 oz)	27.00 / 10 (25oz)	63.00 / 4					
Price Per	3.64 each for 30 oz	6.48 each	6.43 each for 38 oz		2.70 each for 25 oz	15.75 each					
Price Per	0.12	0.17	0.17	\$ 0.13	\$ 0.11	\$ 0.12					
50 lb box Huck Towels (seamed on ends)	no bid	132.85 / 25	42.00 / 25	no bid	51.34 / 10lbs	189.00 / 50lbs					
		\$ 255.70	\$ 84.00		\$ 256.70	\$ 189.00					

Lowest bid on:

	11400 LLC	American Osment	Budget	Quill	Mini Wing	WTM	Unipak	Interboro A	Interboro B	Interboro C	Interboro D
Items not bid (adding lowest bid received to get a true comparison)											
Floor Scrub											
Scrub Brush with Handle											
10" Nylon Brush											
Handle for Nylon Brush											
Broom Head											
Broom Handle											
Large Web Foot Mop Head											
Mop Handle											
36" Soft Rubber Squeegee											
36" Hard Rubber Squeegee											
Squeegee Handle											
Black Stripping Pad											
Mr. Muscle Boil Out Fryer Cleaner											
24 x 33 High Density Can Liners (1000)											
33 x 40 High Density Can Liners (250)											
Dumpster D & C											
50 lb box Huck Towels (seamed on ends)											
Total bid when considering the items not bid											

LOW OVERALL BID